
Carillon Miami Wellness Resort Announces Partnership with Leading Functional Medicine Expert 
Adonis Maiquez, M.D.  

Dr. Adonis Maiquez Joins the Resort's Growing Wellness Team to Provide Best-In-Class Medical Advice 
across an Array of Specialties and Areas of Interest to Guests and Residents  

MIAMI BEACH, Fla., April 18, 2017 /PRNewswire/ -- Carillon Miami Wellness Resort, a world-class 
beachfront boutique hotel and luxury spa in Miami Beach, today announced that leading wellness 
clinician Adonis Maiquez, M.D., ABAARM, will join the Carillon. In his capacity, Dr. Adonis Maiquez will 
provide Carillon residents and guests with access to premier medical advice and will serve as a resource 
for achieving total wellness through proven medical practices to bring the body into complete balance. 

Dr. Adonis Maiquez will begin his residency on April 19, 2017. In addition to clinical practice, he will host 
regular seminars and talks with residents and guests at The Spa at Carillon Miami, the resort's 65,000 
square-foot integrated wellness space that features spa, medical, wellness and fitness programs. Prior to 
joining the Carillon, Dr. Adonis Maiquez was a key member of the medical team at the Miami Institute for 
Age Management and Intervention at the Four Seasons. Certified by the American Academy of Anti-
Aging and Regenerative Medicine, Dr. Adonis Maiquez is also a trained Neurosurgeon and is well-known 
in Miami for his work on a broad spectrum of wellness topics, including the restoration of body chemistry 
affected by the aging process. He is an active member of the Institute for Functional Medicine and the 
American Academy for Anti-Aging Medicine. 

"We are thrilled that Dr. Adonis Maiquez is joining our team and together we are committed to cementing 
Carillon's status as a world-class wellness resort," said James Zenni, Chairman of Carillon Miami 
Wellness Resort's Board of Directors and President and Chief Executive Officer of Z Capital Partners. 
"Dr. Adonis Maiquez brings to Carillon Miami unparalleled experience in the wellness space, and we are 
confident that our guests will appreciate his deep knowledge about achieving total wellness. This is an 
important step in continuing to improve the guest and resident experience and provide them access to 
premier medical professionals across an array of specialties, including orthopedics, reconstruction, 
dentistry, functional medicine and other areas of interest." 

Dr. Adonis Maiquez was a post-grad and fellow in the Department of Surgery and Neurosurgery at the 
University of South Florida in Tampa, where he developed expertise in neurosurgery, neuro-oncology and 
neuro-endocrinology. In addition, Dr. Adonis Maiquez has pursued advanced training in pain 
management and family and preventive medicine. He is fluent in English and Spanish. 

Carillon Miami Wellness Resort is a portfolio company of Z Capital Partners, L.L.C. 

ABOUT CARILLON MIAMI WELLNESS RESORT: 
Located along the white sand shores of Miami Beach, Carillon Miami Wellness Resort presents an 
authentic and specialized approach to health, wellness and complete well-being. Exuding the "luxury of 
wellness," the resort focuses on aligning physical, mental and spiritual health by offering a comprehensive 
retreat, the largest spa in the region (65,000 sq. ft.), a one-of-a-kind Thermal Experience and an 
integrative medical wellness center. The resort features 150 spacious one- and two-bedroom suites, 
ranging in size from 720 – 1,200 sq. ft. An array of recreational activities are at guests' fingertips, with 
over 200 fitness classes offered each week, access to the resort's two-story indoor rock wall and four 
pools located throughout the property: the Sunrise Pool, Cabana Pool, Sunset Pool and the adult-only 
rooftop Atlantic Pool. Serving fresh, locally-sourced, cuisine, the resort features four dining venues 
including Thyme, Carillon Lounge, The Cabana, and the Juice Bar. Carillon Miami Wellness Resort 
promotes a path to discovery and provides tools for a healthier lifestyle extending beyond each guest's 
stay. Carillon Miami Wellness Resort is a member of The Leading Hotels of the World and Leading Spas. 

For more information, please visit www.carillonhotel.com. 

https://protect-us.mimecast.com/s/3RX5BYueJEphw?domain=carillonhotel.com
http://www.carillonhotel.com/


ABOUT Z CAPITAL PARTNERS 
Z Capital Group, L.L.C. is a leading alternative asset management firm with $2.3 billion in regulatory 
assets under management across complementary private equity and credit businesses. Z Capital 
manages both opportunistic, value-oriented private equity and credit funds with offices in New York, NY 
and Lake Forest, IL. 

Z Capital's investors are some of the largest and most sophisticated global institutional investors in North 
America, Europe, Asia, Africa and the Middle East including, public and corporate pension funds, 
university endowments, foundations, sovereign wealth funds, central banks, and insurance companies. 

For more information, please visit www.zcapgroup.net. 
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